
 
 

 
UNITED STATES

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE COMMISSION
Washington, D.C. 20549

 

FORM 8-K
 

CURRENT REPORT
PURSUANT TO SECTION 13 OR 15(d) of THE SECURITIES EXCHANGE ACT OF 1934

 
Date of Report (Date of earliest event reported): May 4, 2021

 
 

 

DELUXE CORPORATION
(Exact Name of Registrant as Specified in Its Charter)

 
MN   1-7945   41-0216800

(State or Other Jurisdiction of
Incorporation)  

(Commission File Number)
 

(I.R.S. Employer
Identification Number)

 
3680 Victoria St. N.

Shoreview, MN 55126-2966
(Address of principal executive offices and zip code)

 
(651)  483-7111

(Registrant’s telephone number, including area code)
 

Former name or former address, if changed since last report: Not Applicable
 

 

 
Check the appropriate box below if the Form 8-K filing is intended to simultaneously satisfy the filing obligation of the registrant under any of the following provisions (see
General Instruction A.2. below):
 
¨ Written communications pursuant to Rule 425 under the Securities Act (17 CFR 230.425)
 
¨ Soliciting material pursuant to Rule 14a-12 under the Exchange Act (17 CFR 240.14a-12)
 
¨ Pre-commencement communications pursuant to Rule 14d-2(b) under the Exchange Act (17 CFR 240.14d-2(b))
 
¨ Pre-commencement communications pursuant to Rule 13e-4(c) under the Exchange Act (17 CFR 240.13e-4(c))
 
Securities registered pursuant to Section 12(b) of the Act:
 

Title of each class   Trading Symbol   Name of each exchange on which registered
Common Stock, par value $1.00 per share   DLX   NYSE

 
Indicate by check mark whether the registrant is an emerging growth company as defined in Rule 405 of the Securities Act of 1933 (§230.405 of this chapter) or Rule 12b-2 of
the Securities Exchange Act of 1934 (§240.12b-2 of this chapter).
 
Emerging growth company ¨
 
If an emerging growth company, indicate by check mark if the registrant has elected not to use the extended transition period for complying with any new or revised financial
accounting standards provided pursuant to Section 13(a) of the Exchange Act. ¨
 
 

 



 

 
Item 1.01 Entry into a Material Definitive Agreement.
 

As previously disclosed, on April 21, 2021, Deluxe Corporation, a Minnesota corporation (the “Company”), entered into an Agreement and Plan of Merger (the “Merger
Agreement”) by and among the Company, FAPS Holdings, Inc., a Delaware corporation (“FAPS”), Fox Acquirer Sub, Inc., a wholly owned subsidiary of the Company
(“Merger Sub”) and Applepoint FAPS Holdings LP, a Delaware limited partnership (the “Stockholder Representative”), solely in its capacity as the Stockholder Representative
(as defined in the Merger Agreement). Pursuant to the terms and conditions of the Merger Agreement, on the closing date, Merger Sub will merge with and into FAPS, with
FAPS surviving such merger as a wholly owned subsidiary of the Company (the “FAPS Acquisition”).

 
On May 4, 2021 the Company entered into that certain Amendment (the “Amendment”), amending the Credit Agreement dated as of March 21, 2018 (the “Existing Credit

Agreement”), by and among the Company, as borrower, the several banks and other financial institutions or entities from time to time parties thereto (the “Lenders”), JPMorgan
Chase Bank, N.A., as administrative agent, and the other agents party thereto.

 
Under the terms of the Amendment, the Lenders agreed to (i) permit the Company to incur secured indebtedness to consummate the FAPS Acquisition, subject to certain

conditions and a maximum aggregate principal amount, (ii) consent to the FAPS Acquisition on the terms and conditions set forth in the Merger Agreement, (iii) effective upon
the consummation of the FAPS Acquisition, (x) increase the swingline and letter of credit facilities by $5 million each and (y) make certain adjustments to the negative and
financial covenants under the Existing Credit Agreement, and (iv) amend certain other provisions of the Existing Credit Agreement.

 
The foregoing description of the Amendment is not intended to be complete and is qualified in its entirety by reference to the Amendment, a copy of which is attached

hereto as Exhibit 10.1, and incorporated herein by reference.
 

Item 2.03 Creation of a Direct Financial Obligation or an Obligation under an Off-Balance Sheet Arrangement of a Registrant.
 

The information set forth in Item 1.01 is incorporated by reference into this Item 2.03.
 

Cautionary Statement Regarding Forward-Looking Statements
 

Statements made in this Current Report on Form 8-K concerning the Company, the Company’s or management’s intentions, expectations, outlook or predictions about
future results or events are “forward-looking statements” within the meaning of the Private Securities Litigation Reform Act of 1995. Such statements reflect management’s
current intentions or beliefs and are subject to risks and uncertainties that could cause actual results or events to vary from stated expectations, which variations could be
material and adverse. Factors that could produce such a variation include, but are not limited to, the following: potential continuing negative impacts from pandemic health
issues, such as the coronavirus / COVID-19, along with the impact of government restrictions or similar directives on our future results of operations, the Company’s future
financial condition and the Company’s ability to continue business activities in affected regions; the impact that further deterioration or prolonged softness in the economy may
have on demand for the Company’s products and services; the Company’s ability to execute its transformational strategy and to realize the intended benefits; the inherent
unreliability of earnings, revenue and cash flow predictions due to numerous factors, many of which are beyond the Company’s control; declining demand for the Company’s
checks, check-related products and services and business forms; risks that the Company’s strategies intended to drive sustained revenue and earnings growth, despite the
continuing decline in checks and forms, are delayed or unsuccessful; intense competition; continued consolidation of financial institutions and/or additional bank failures,
thereby reducing the number of potential customers and referral sources and increasing downward pressure on the Company’s revenue and gross profit; the risk that the FAPS
Acquisition and/or any other future acquisitions will not be consummated; risks that any such acquisitions do not produce the anticipated results or synergies; risks that the
Company’s cost reduction initiatives will be delayed or unsuccessful; performance shortfalls by one or more of the Company’s major suppliers, licensors or service providers;
unanticipated delays, costs and expenses in the development and marketing of products and services, including web services and financial technology and treasury management
solutions; the failure of such products and services to deliver the expected revenues and other financial targets; risks related to security breaches, computer malware or other
cyber-attacks; risks of interruptions to the Company’s website operations or information technology systems; risks of unfavorable outcomes and the costs to defend litigation
and other disputes; and the impact of governmental laws, regulations or investigations. The Company’s forward-looking statements speak only as of the time made, and
management assumes no obligation to publicly update any such statements. Additional information concerning these and other factors that could cause actual results and events
to differ materially from the Company’s current expectations are contained in the Company’s Form 10-K for the year ended December 31, 2020. The Company undertakes no
obligation to update or revise any forward-looking statements to reflect subsequent events, new information or future circumstances.
 

 



 

 
Item 9.01 Financial Statements and Exhibits.
 
(d) Exhibits
 

Exhibit
Number Description of Exhibit

10.1 Amendment, dated as of May 4, 2021, to the Credit Agreement, dated as of March 21, 2018, by and among Deluxe Corporation, as Borrower, the several banks
and other financial institutions or entities from time to time parties thereto, JPMorgan Chase Bank, N.A., as administrative agent, and the other agents party
thereto

104 Cover Page Interactive Data File (embedded within the Inline XBRL document)

 

 

https://content.equisolve.net/deluxe/sec/0001104659-21-063080/for_pdf/tm2115446d1_ex10-1.htm
https://content.equisolve.net/deluxe/sec/0001104659-21-063080/for_pdf/tm2115446d1_ex10-1.htm


 

 
SIGNATURE

 
Pursuant to the requirements of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, the registrant has duly caused this report to be signed on its behalf by the undersigned hereunto duly

authorized.
 

Date: May 7, 2021 DELUXE CORPORATION
   
  By: Jeffrey L. Cotter
  Name: Jeffrey L. Cotter
  Title: Chief Administrative Officer,

Senior Vice President and General Counsel
 

 



 
Exhibit 10.1

 
Execution Version

 
AMENDMENT

 
AMENDMENT, dated as of May 4, 2021 (this “Amendment”), to the CREDIT AGREEMENT, dated as of March 21, 2018, among DELUXE

CORPORATION, as Borrower, the several banks and other financial institutions or entities from time to time parties thereto (the “Lenders”), JPMORGAN CHASE BANK,
N.A., as administrative agent (the “Administrative Agent”), and the other agents party thereto.

 
W I T N E S S E T H:

 
WHEREAS, the Borrower, the Lenders and the Administrative Agent are parties to the Credit Agreement; and
 
WHEREAS, the Borrower has requested, and the Lenders and the Administrative Agent have agreed to enter into this amendment of the Credit Agreement;
 
NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the premises and mutual covenants contained herein, and for good and valuable consideration, the receipt and

sufficiency of which are hereby acknowledged, the parties hereto hereby agree as follows:
 

I. DEFINED TERMS
 

Capitalized terms used but not defined herein shall have the meanings assigned to such terms in the Credit Agreement.
 

II. AMENDMENT TO THE CREDIT AGREEMENT
 

(a)       Effective upon the Amendment Effective Date, the Credit Agreement is hereby amended as follows:
 

(i)       Amendments to Section 1.01 (Defined Terms). Section 1.01 of the Credit Agreement shall be amended to insert the following new defined terms in
appropriate alphabetical order:

 
“FAPS Acquisition” means the acquisition by the Borrower of FAPS Holdings, Inc., pursuant to and in accordance with the FAPS Acquisition Agreement.
 
“FAPS Acquisition Agreement” means that certain Agreement and Plan of Merger, dated as of April 21, 2021, by and among the Borrower, Fox Acquirer Sub,

Inc., FAPS Holdings, Inc. and Applepoint FAPS Holdings LP (solely in its capacity as the Stockholder Representative).
 
(ii) Amendments to Section 4.02 (Each Credit Event). Section 4.02 of the Credit Agreement shall be amended to add the following sentence at the end

thereof:
 

“Notwithstanding the terms of this Section 4.02 or of any other term or condition of this Agreement or any of the Loan Documents, the making of
Loans hereunder to consummate the FAPS Acquisition, in the amounts permitted by Section 5.08(iii) and (iv), shall be subject only to the conditions
precedent set forth on Schedule 4.02 hereof.
 

 



 

 
(iii)       Amendments to Section 5.08 (Use of Proceeds). Section 5.08 of the Credit Agreement shall be amended as follows:
 

(A)       the following text shall be inserted immediately prior to the word “and” at the end of clause (ii) thereof: “, (iii) in an aggregate amount not to
exceed $50,000,000 to finance the FAPS Acquisition, (iv) to fund any original issue discount or upfront fees payable in connection with Indebtedness incurred in
connection with the FAPS Acquisition and ”; and

 
(B)        existing clause (iii) thereof shall be renumbered as clause (v).

 
(iv) Amendments to Section 6.01 (Indebtedness). Section 6.01 of the Credit Agreement shall be amended as follows:

 
(A)       the word “and” at the end of clause (m) thereof shall be deleted;
 
(B)        the “.” at the end of clause (n) thereof shall be deleted and the text “; and” shall be substituted in lieu thereof;

 
(C)        the following new clause (o) shall be added in appropriate alphabetical order:
 
“(o)      Indebtedness of the Borrower to finance the FAPS Acquisition (and any refinancing Indebtedness in respect thereof) in an aggregate principal
amount not to exceed $1,050,000,000 (plus any additional amounts to fund any original issue discount in respect thereof); provided that (i) to the
extent such Indebtedness is incurred prior to, and not substantially contemporaneously with, the consummation of the FAPS Acquisition, the
definitive documentation in respect of such Indebtedness includes a mandatory redemption requirement if the FAPS Acquisition does not close by
September 21, 2021 (or if the End Date under the FAPS Acquisition Agreement is extended, such later date) and (ii) such Indebtedness (and any
refinancing Indebtedness in respect thereof) (A) either is secured only by the Collateral and on a pari passu or junior basis with the Secured
Obligations and remains at all times subject to a customary intercreditor agreement in form and substance reasonably satisfactory to the
Administrative Agent or is unsecured and (B) is guaranteed only by the Subsidiary Guarantors (any Indebtedness satisfying each of the foregoing
conditions, “Permitted Acquisition Debt”).”

 
(v)        Amendments to Section 6.02 (Liens). Section 6.02 of the Credit Agreement shall be amended as follows:
 

(A)       the word “and” at the end of clause (h) thereof shall be deleted;
 
(B)        the “.” at the end of clause (i) thereof shall be deleted and the text “; and” shall be substituted in lieu thereof; and
 
(C)        the following new clause (j) shall be added in appropriate alphabetical order:
 
“(j)       Liens on the Collateral securing Indebtedness incurred to finance the FAPS Acquisition pursuant to Section 6.01(o) (and to the extent such
Indebtedness was secured, refinancing Indebtedness incurred in respect thereof), which Permitted Acquisition Debt, for the avoidance of doubt, shall
at times be subject to an intercreditor agreement in form and substance reasonably satisfactory to the Administrative Agent.”
 

 



 

 
(vi) Amendments to Section 6.03 (Fundamental Changes and Asset Sales). Section 6.03 of the Credit Agreement shall be amended to amend and restate

clause (ix) thereof to read as follows:
 

(ix)        the Borrower and its subsidiaries may consummate the merger contemplated by the FAPS Acquisition Agreement;”.
 
(vii)        Amendments to Section 6.04 (Investments, Loans, Advances, Guarantees and Acquisitions). Section 6.04 of the Credit Agreement shall be amended

as follows:
 

(A)       the word “and” at the end of clause (n) thereof shall be deleted;
 
(B)        the “.” at the end of clause (o) thereof shall be deleted and the text “; and” shall be substituted in lieu thereof; and
 
(C)        the following new clause (p) shall be added in appropriate alphabetical order:
 
“(p)      the FAPS Acquisition.”

 
(viii) Amendments to Section 6.08 (Restrictive Agreements). Section 6.08 of the Credit Agreement shall be amended by inserting after the text “definitive

documentation in respect of any Permitted Senior Secured Notes” in clause (ix) of the proviso thereto the text “, Indebtedness permitted pursuant to Section 6.01(o)
hereof”.

 
(ix)         Amendment to Schedules. The Credit Agreement is hereby amended to add, in appropriate order, a new Schedule 4.02 in the form of Schedule 4.02

attached hereto and incorporated herein by reference.
 

(b)       Effective upon the consummation of the FAPS Acquisition, the Credit Agreement is hereby amended as follows:
 

(i)         Amendments to Section 1.01 (Defined Terms). (A) Section 1.01 of the Credit Agreement shall be amended to insert the following new defined terms
in appropriate alphabetical order:

 
“Consolidated Secured Indebtedness” means Consolidated Total Indebtedness that is secured by a Lien on any assets of the Borrower or any of its

Subsidiaries.
 
(B)         Section 1.01 of the Credit Agreement shall be amended to amend the definition of “Consolidated EBIT” as follows:
 
               (x)          the word “and” at the end of clause (a)(v) thereof shall be deleted;
 
               (y)         clause (a)(vi) thereof shall be deleted and the following text shall be substituted in lieu thereof:
 
“restructuring charges or reserves, including write-downs and write-offs, including any one-time costs incurred in connection with the FAPS Acquisition and
Permitted Acquisitions and costs related to the opening, closure, consolidation or integration of facilities, information technology infrastructure and legal
entities, and severance and retention bonuses; provided that (x) amounts added back pursuant to this clause (vi) shall be actual and not projected and (y) cash
amounts added back pursuant to this clause (vi), together with amounts added pursuant to clause (vii) below (other than any cost savings, operating expense
reductions, operating improvements and synergies in respect of historical periods set forth in the financial model delivered to the Administrative Agent on
April 14, 2021), for any Reference Period shall not exceed 20.0% of Consolidated EBIT for such Reference Period (as calculated before giving effect to any
such addbacks) and”; and
 

 



 

 
               (z)          the following new clause (a)(vii) shall be inserted immediately after clause (a)(vi) thereof:
 
“(vii) “run-rate” cost savings, operating expense reductions, operating improvements and synergies of the Borrower and its Subsidiaries related to the FAPS
Acquisition, mergers and other business combinations, acquisitions, divestitures, restructurings, insourcing initiatives, cost savings initiatives and other
similar initiatives (net of amounts actually realized), (i) for which actions have been taken or are expected to be taken or with respect to which substantial
steps have been taken or are expected to be taken (in the good faith determination of the Borrower) within 18 months of such Acquisition or other
transaction, as applicable, (ii) that have been or are projected by the Borrower in good faith to be realized within 18 months after the date of the FAPS
Acquisition or such other transaction, as applicable and (iii) that are reasonably identifiable and factually supportable (in the good faith determination of the
Borrower, as certified in a certificate of a Financial Officer of the Borrower; provided that amounts added pursuant to this clause (vii) (other than any cost
savings, operating expense reductions, operating improvements and synergies in respect of historical periods set forth in the financial model delivered to the
Administrative Agent on April 14, 2021), together with amounts added back pursuant to clause (vi) above, for any Reference Period shall not exceed 20.0%
of Consolidated EBIT for such Reference Period (as calculated before giving effect to any such addbacks),”

 
(ii) Amendment to Section 2.05 (Swingline Loans). Section 2.05(a) of the Credit Agreement is hereby amended by deleting the figure “$35,000,000” and by

substituting therefor the figure “$40,000,000”.
 
(iii)       Amendment to Section 2.06 (Letters of Credit). Section 2.06(b) of the Credit Agreement is hereby amended by deleting the figure “$20,000,000”

and by substituting therefor the figure “$25,000,000”.
 

(iv)         Amendments to Section 6.04 (Investments, Loans, Advances, Guarantees and Acquisitions). Section 6.04 of the Credit Agreement shall be amended
as to amend and restate clause (d) thereof to read as follows:

 
“(d)        Investments, loans or advances made by the Borrower in or to any Subsidiary and made by any Subsidiary in or to the Borrower or any other

Subsidiary (provided that not more than an aggregate amount of $50,000,000 in Investments, loans or advances or capital contributions may be made after the consummation of
the FAPS Acquisition and remain outstanding by Loan Parties to Subsidiaries which are not Loan Parties);”.

 

 



 

 
(v)          Amendments to Section 6.12 (Financial Covenants). 6.12 of the Credit Agreement shall be deleted in its entirety and the following shall be

substituted in lieu thereof:
 
“(a)        Maximum Leverage Ratio. The Borrower will not permit the ratio (the “Leverage Ratio”) as of the last day of any fiscal quarter of (i) the sum of
(x) Consolidated Total Indebtedness at such time minus (y) the amount of Unrestricted Cash in excess of $15,000,000 at such time to (ii) Consolidated
EBITDA for the period of four consecutive fiscal quarters of the Borrower then ending, all calculated for the Borrower and its Subsidiaries on a consolidated
basis, to be greater than (A) 5.00 to 1.00 for the first fiscal quarter ending on or after the date of consummation of the FAPS Acquisition through the fiscal
quarter ending March 31, 2022, (B) 4.75 to 1.00 for the fiscal quarters ending June 30, 2022 through March 31, 2023, (C) 4.50 to 1.00 for the fiscal quarters
ending June 30, 2023 through March 31, 2024 and (D) 4.25 to 1.00 for the fiscal quarters ending June 30, 2024 and thereafter; provided that the ratio set forth
in clause (D) shall be increased, upon the written election by the Borrower to the Administrative Agent, to 4.50:1.00 (a “Covenant Holiday”) for the four
fiscal quarter period following any Permitted Acquisition the aggregate consideration of which is equal to or greater than $150,000,000, which four fiscal
quarter period shall commence with the fiscal quarter in which such Permitted Acquisition occurred; provided that (i) there shall be no more than two
Covenant Holidays and (ii) there shall be a period of at least two fiscal quarters in which no Covenant Holiday is in effect prior to the effectiveness of a
second Covenant Holiday.
 
(b)          Maximum Secured Leverage Ratio. The Borrower will not permit the ratio (the “Secured Leverage Ratio”) as of the last day of any fiscal quarter of
(i) the sum of (x) Consolidated Secured Indebtedness at such time minus (y) the amount of Unrestricted Cash in excess of $15,000,000 at such time to
(ii) Consolidated EBITDA for the period of four consecutive fiscal quarters of the Borrower then ending, all calculated for the Borrower and its Subsidiaries
on a consolidated basis, to be greater than (A) 4.00 to 1.00 for the first fiscal quarter ending on or after the date of consummation of the FAPS Acquisition
through the fiscal quarter ending March 31, 2022, (B) 3.75 to 1.00 for the fiscal quarters ending June 30, 2022 through March 31, 2023 and (C) 3.50 to 1.00
for the fiscal quarters ending June 30, 2023 and thereafter.
 
(c)          Minimum Interest Coverage Ratio. The Borrower will not permit the ratio (the “Interest Coverage Ratio”) as of the last day of any fiscal quarter of
(i) Consolidated EBITDA for the period of four consecutive fiscal quarters of the Borrower then ending to (ii) Consolidated Interest Expense for the period of
four consecutive fiscal quarters of the Borrower then ending, all calculated for the Borrower and its Subsidiaries on a consolidated basis, to be less than (A)
2.75 to 1.00 for the first fiscal quarter ending on or after the date of consummation of the FAPS Acquisition through the fiscal quarter ending March 31, 2022
and (B) 3.00 to 1.00 for the fiscal quarters ending June 30, 2022 and thereafter.”

III. CONSENT
 

To the extent required under the Credit Agreement or any of the Loan Documents, the Required Lenders hereby consent to the FAPS Acquisition on the terms
and conditions set forth in the FAPS Acquisition Agreement as in effect on the date hereof.

 

 



 

 
IV. REPRESENTATIONS

 
The Borrower hereby represents that (i) the representations and warranties of the Borrower set forth in the Loan Documents are true and correct in all respects

with respect to representations and warranties containing qualifications as to materiality or Material Adverse Effect, and true and correct in all material respects with respect to
representations and warranties without qualifications as to materiality or Material Adverse Effect, on and as of the Amendment Effective Date, except to the extent such
representations and warranties specifically relate to an earlier date, in which case such representations and warranties shall have been true and correct in all material respects on
and as of such earlier date and (ii) at the time of and immediately after giving effect to the Amendment Effective Date, no Default or Event of Default has occurred and is
continuing.

 
V. EFFECTIVENESS

 
This Amendment shall become effective on the date (the “Amendment Effective Date”) on which all of the following conditions precedent have been

satisfied or waived:
 

(i)           the Administrative Agent shall have received this Amendment, duly executed and delivered by a duly authorized officer of each of (A) the Borrower,
(B) the Administrative Agent and (C) the Required Lenders; and

 
(ii)          the Administrative Agent shall have received all fees and other amounts due and payable on or prior to the Amendment Effective Date, including, to

the extent invoiced, reimbursement or payment of all out-of-pocket expenses (including fees, charges and disbursements of counsel) required to be reimbursed or paid
by any Loan Party hereunder or under any Loan Document.

 
VI. MISCELLANEOUS

 
A.          Effect on the Loan Documents.
 
(i)           Except as specifically amended hereby, the provisions of the Credit Agreement are and shall remain in full force and effect and are hereby in all

respects ratified and confirmed.
 
(ii)          The execution, delivery and effectiveness of this Amendment shall not operate as a waiver of any right, power or remedy of any Lender or the

Administrative Agent under any of the Loan Documents, nor constitute a waiver of any provision of any of the Loan Documents.
 
(iii)         On and after the Amendment Effective Date, each reference in the Credit Agreement to “this Agreement”, “hereunder”, “hereof”, “herein”, or words

of like import referring to the Credit Agreement, and each reference in the other Loan Documents to the “Credit Agreement”, “thereunder”, “thereof”, or words of like
import referring to the Credit Agreement shall mean and be a reference to the Credit Agreement after giving effect to this Amendment.

 
(iv)         The Borrower and the other parties hereto acknowledge and agree that this Amendment shall constitute a Loan Document.
 

 



 

 
B.           Counterparts. This Amendment may be executed in counterparts (and by different parties hereto in different counterparts), each of which shall

constitute an original, but all of which when taken together shall constitute a single contract. Delivery of an executed counterpart of a signature page of this Amendment by
telecopy, e-mailed pdf, or any other electronic means that reproduces an image of the actual executed signature page shall be effective as delivery of a manually executed
counterpart of this Amendment. The words “execution,” “signed,” “signature,” “delivery,” and words of like import in or relating to this Amendment and/or any document to be
signed in connection with this Amendment and the transactions contemplated hereby shall be deemed to include Electronic Signatures (as defined below), deliveries or the
keeping of records in electronic form, each of which shall be of the same legal effect, validity or enforceability as a manually executed signature, physical delivery thereof or
the use of a paper-based recordkeeping system, as the case may be. As used herein, “Electronic Signatures” means any electronic symbol or process attached to, or associated
with, any contract or other record and adopted by a person with the intent to sign, authenticate or accept such contract or record.    
 

C.           GOVERNING LAW. THIS AMENDMENT SHALL BE CONSTRUED IN ACCORDANCE WITH AND GOVERNED BY THE LAW OF THE
STATE OF NEW YORK.

 
D.           Expenses. The Borrower agrees to pay or reimburse the Administrative Agent for all of its reasonable and invoiced out-of-pocket costs and expenses

incurred in connection with the preparation, negotiation and execution of this Amendment, including, without limitation, the reasonable and invoiced fees, charges and
disbursements of counsel to the Administrative Agent in connection with the preparation and administration of this Amendment and the other Loan Documents or any
amendments, modifications or waivers of the provisions hereof or thereof (whether or not the transactions contemplated hereby or thereby shall be consummated).

 
[Remainder of Page Intentionally Left Blank]

 

 



 

 
IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have caused this Amendment to be duly executed and delivered by their proper and duly authorized officers as

of the day and year first above written.
 

  DELUXE CORPORATION, as the Borrower
   
  By: /s/ Keith A. Bush
    Name: Keith A. Bush
    Title: Senior Vice President and Chief Financial Officer

 
[Signature Page to Amendment]

 

 



 

 
  JPMORGAN CHASE BANK, N.A., as Administrative Agent and a Lender
     
  By: /s/ Suzanne Ergastolo
    Name: Suzanne Ergastolo
    Title: Executive Director

 
[Signature Page to Amendment]

 

 



 

 
  MUFG BANK, LTD., as a Lender
     
  By: /s/ Samantha Schumacher
    Name: Samantha Schumacher
    Title: Authorized Signatory
 

[Signature Page to Amendment]
 

 



 

 
  TRUIST BANK, as a Lender
     
  By: /s/ Brian M. Lewis
    Name: Brian M. Lewis
    Title: Managing Director
 

[Signature Page to Amendment]
 

 



 

 
  FIFTH THIRD BANK, NATIONAL ASSOCIATION, as a Lender
     
  By: /s/ Ann Kyne
    Name: Ann Kyne
    Title: Assistant Vice President

 
[Signature Page to Amendment]

 

 



 

 
  U.S. BANK NATIONAL ASSOCIATION, as a Lender
     
  By: /s/ Peter I. Bystol
    Name: Peter I. Bystol
    Title: Senior Vice President
 

[Signature Page to Amendment]
 

 

 


